
Healthcare,Sanitation and Nutrition: 
 
NEEPCO is executing various Healthcare, Sanitation and Nutrition programme for 
upliftment of Health care facilities in the vicinity of the project areas as well as at its 
area of operation.  In the last 6(Six) years, NEEPCO has made expenditure of Rs 
12.46 Cr which is more than 25% of its CSR budget for upliftment of health care 
facilities in its areas of operation. The Healthcare activities include Free Health check-
up camps, donation of ambulances, providing drinking water facilities, providing 
medical equipment to health centers and financial assistance to Yoga Wellness 
Centres etc. Health camp largely benefits the elderly people living in the remote areas 
in and around the project sites.  

 
Initiative taken by NEEPCO:  

Since inception, NEEPCO has been providing sincere medical intervention to fill-up 
the deficits of access to primary healthcare and basic healthcare facilities in 
neighbourhood of its project sites. The interventions include, up-gradation of primary 
and community health centres, donation of ambulance, health awareness camps, 
medical camps, financial assistance for treatment requiring special attention.   
 
Free cleft & cleft palate surgery is one of the most successful interventions made by 
NEEPCO in the field of Preventive Health Care.  
 
To deal with the kind of emergency or distress situation such as that posed by COVID-
19 pandemic NEEPCO has contributed Rs 4.40 Crore to the PM CARES Fund. 

 

Photographs of Healthcare initiatives undertaken by NEEPCO: 
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DONATION OF AMBULANCE TO CITIZENS FOUNDATION, SHILLONG 

MoA signed between Raj Bhavan, Shillong and NEEPCO under the  Pradhan Mantri TB Mukt Bharat Abhiyaan for 

nutritional support to 250 numbers of  TB patients in Meghalaya 



 
Medical camp organised by WUHEP, NEEPCO, Mawsynram, Meghalaya. 

 
Handing over of Force Traveller (13+D) AC Vehicle to Dr. B. Borooah Cancer 
Institute, Guwahati 

 
Donation of Ambulance to Red Cross Hospital, Guwahati, Assam 



 
Critical Care ICU Ventilators donated to the Civil Hospital, Aizawl, Mizoram. 

 
Handing Over of items for Community Health Centre, Jang, Distt.- Tawang, 
Arunachal Pradesh. 

 

 
Providing an Ambulance to Nidaya Primary Health Centre, Sonamura, Tripura 



 
 

 

 

Aspirational District: Ribhoi Meghalaya: 

NEEPCO under its CSR initiatives has constructed16 numbers of Anganwadi Centre 

in various locations/villages in the Ribhoi District, Meghalaya. 

Medical Equipment was sponsored under CSR initiatives by NEEPCO during 2020-21 

for Civil Hospital Nongpoh at sanctioned amount of Rs. 1.24 Crore. Medical Machines 

and Equipment such as Centralized Gas Pipeline (Oxygen & Vacuum) system for the 

different wards in Hospital Sterile areas like ICU, OT, New Born Sick Unit, Labour 

Room etc. were very effective in present pandemic situation.  Also, a High definition 

Laparoscope Set was sponsored so that patients do not have to travel to Shillong or 

Guwahati for basic Laparoscopic surgeries. 

 
Newly constructed Anganwadi Centre at Umkaduh-II, Ri Bhoi Distt., Meghalaya 
 



 
Donation of 3 (three) Nos. Ambulances to 3 nos. villages in Ribhoi District, 
Meghalaya. 

 
The Labour Room of the Hospital Fully-equipped with Centralised Oxygen 
Pipeline of Civil Hospital, Nongpoh, Ribhoi Distt., Meghalaya. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

The Shillong Times 30th October, 2020 

 



 

 



 
Providing Medical equipments to Nongpoh Civil Hospital, Ribhoi District, 
Meghalaya 
 

 
 

 

CSR ACTIVITIES DURING COVID-19 PANDEMIC: As a responsible corporate citizen 

NEEPCO is making all efforts towards containment of the spread of COVID-19 

pandemic. Therefore, considering the COVID- 19 situation, NEEPCO has distributed 

PPE items such as triple layer masks, hand sanitizers and liquid hand wash to the 

populace in and around its operational areas. NEEPCO under its CSR initiative 



committed to stand with front line health and medical staff who are at the forefront of 

protecting society from COVID-19. In this regard, PPE kits and Face Masks were also 

donated to the North Eastern Indira Gandhi Regional Institute of Health and Medical 

Sciences (NEIGRIHMS), Shillong and to the Guwahati Municipal Corporation (GMC) 

for further distribution among municipal workers deployed for fighting COVID-19.  

Apart from this under its CSR initiatives NEEPCO has also contributed to the PM 

CARES Fund. Also the CSR projects/programs which were sanctioned previous years 

handed over to the beneficiaries and stakeholders.  

India has rolled out the world's largest Covid vaccination programme and is in the 

process to reach each and every part of the country so that no citizen is left in the 

COVID Vaccination Program.   

In this noble initiative, NEEPCO was entrusted with the responsibility to provide Cold 

Chain Equipment’s to the State of Meghalaya to combat the pandemic. As per the 

allocation plan, NEEPCO under its CSR scheme provided CCE equipment to the 

Ribhoi, East Khasi Hills, East Jaintia Hills, West Jaintia Hills District, and to the State 

Capital Shillong. 

 

 
 



 
 

 

 
 

 


